From: Domoni Jordan <djorda76@kennesaw.edu>
Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 5:20 PM

To: Renee Gamache <rgamache@kennesaw.edu>
Cc: LaToya Harris <lharr187@kennesaw.edu>
Subject: RE: Student of the Year Awards

Thank you for this information. Each student’s account has been properly reviewed and
approved for this financial resource. Each student is eligible for this award. You may proceed
with processing their payments.

Please let me know if there is anything further I may assist you with. Be safe! Have a great day.

Mrs. Domoni Jordan
Associate Director — Compliance, Scholarships, and Training
Enrollment Services - Student Financial Aid
585 Cobb Ave NW
Office 1531, MD 0119
Kennesaw, GA 30144
KENNESAW STATE p: 470-578-3565
PR ALY e: djorda76@kennesaw.edu
w: financialaid.kennesaw.edu

FAFSA SEASON:

From: Renee Gamache <rgamache@kennesaw.edu>
Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 5:02 PM

To: Domoni Jordan <djorda76@kennesaw.edu>
Subject: Re: Student of the Year Awards

Domoni,

Here are the KSU ID's. | believe the winning requirements are included in the attachments | sent
you earlier. In the justification paragraphs.
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Renee G

Ms. Renee Gamache
Office Manager
Department of Engineering Technology

840 Polytechnic Lane
Room Q-236, MD 9070
Marietta, GA 30060

p: 470-578-7274
e: rgamache@kennesaw.edu
w: https://engineering.kennesaw.edu/engineering-technology/

KSU Well-Being Champion, OEM Crisis Coordinator (Tech107), and CERT, CPR, & EpiPen Certified

KSU Students, please include your first and last name, along with your KSU ID#, to ANY correspondence.

From: Domoni Jordan <djorda76@kennesaw.edu>
Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 4:29 PM
To: Renee Gamache <rgamache@kennesaw.edu>
Subject: RE: Student of the Year Awards

Good afternoon, Renee:

Thank you for your email. Would you please send me the KSU # for the students who are the
recipients of the award? I will need to review their accounts to ensure they are eligible for the
award. Also, are their any stipulations on eligibility based on GPA, enrollment, financial need,
etc.? Thank you in advance for the information.

And, no!! I was not aware that you would be leaving next month!! I wish you all the best and
much success in your future endeavors! Thank you for letting me know.

Mrs. Domoni Jordan
Associate Director — Compliance, Scholarships, and Training
Enrollment Services - Student Financial Aid

\ 585 Cobb Ave NW

Office 1531, MD 0119

Kennesaw, GA 30144



p: 470-578-3565
e: djorda76(@kennesaw.edu
w: financialaid.kennesaw.edu

FAESA SEABON:

From: Renee Gamache <rgamache@kennesaw.edu>
Sent: Thursday, March 31, 2022 3:14 PM

To: Domoni Jordan <djorda76@kennesaw.edu>
Subject: Student of the Year Awards

Importance: High

Hi Domoni,

It has been brought to my attention that | need to get your approval for a cash award for our
students of the year. This is new for me since this was not required in past years. My apologies
for not coming to you sooner. | have attached a few files to better explain the requests.

Let me know if you need anything else. FYI, | will be on vacation April 4-8, 2022. Also, | don't
know if you are aware or not, but my last day with KSU will be April 15, 2022. | will be moving
over to GTRI, Marietta.

Renee G

Ms. Renee Gamache
Office Manager
Department of Engineering Technology

840 Polytechnic Lane
Room Q-236, MD 9070
Marietta, GA 30060



p: 470-578-7274
e: rgamache@kennesaw.edu
w: https://engineering.kennesaw.edu/engineering-technology/




