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Each Double Owl Pathway
has different requirements,
and every student’s situation is
unique. Meet with your
academic advisor to create a
personalized plan. They will
review your current classes,
assess if the pathway is a good
fit, and recommend courses to
support your academic
success.

Find your academic advisor.1.
Schedule your academic
advising appointment.

2.

Your advisor will help you
complete the rest of this
checklist. 

3.

MEET WITH YOUR
ACADEMIC ADVISOR

Declare a Business Major
through OwlExpress. 

1.

Complete BUSA 2150 with a
grade of “S”.

2.

Complete the following 7
courses with a GPA of 3.00 or
higher, including a grade of C or
better in each course (an equal
number of Cs and As earned):

3.

ACCT 2101 Principles of
Accounting I (ACCT 2100)
ACCT 2102 Principles of
Accounting II (ACCT 2200)
ECON 2105 Principles of
Macroeconomics (ECON 2200)
ECON 2106 Principles of
Microeconomics (ECON 2100)
ECON 2300 Business Statistics
IS 2200 Information Systems &
Communication
BLAW 2200 Legal and Ethical
Environment of Business

APPLY TO COLES
COLLEGE 

Each Double Owl Pathway has
different admissions
requirements. Follow these
steps to confirm you meet the
requirements: 

Visit the Double Owl Pathways
website.

1.

Use the search bar or scroll
through the list below to find
your major.

2.

After you click on your major,
confirm you meet the Double
Owl Admission Requirements:

3.

Minimum GPA
Minimum hours completed
toward bachelor’s degree
Minimum 30 hours
completed at KSU

 CONFIRM THAT YOU
MEET THE

REQUIREMENTS FOR
YOUR PROGRAM 

Are you eligible to be a Double Owl?
Complete this checklist before you apply: 
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